
POST:    SCIENTIST PRODUCTION GRADE A REF:040414/12  
Water Services Regulation 
 

SALARY: R 414 264 per annum (offer based on proven years of experience) 
CENTRE:   Mmabatho 
 
REQUIREMENTS: Science Degree (BSc) (Hon) or relevant qualification. Compulsory 

registration with the SACNASP as a professional Natural Scientist 
(proof of registration must be attached). Three (3) years post-
qualification relevant experience. Valid driver’s licence (certified 
copy must be attached).  Extensive experience in the field of 
drinking water and wastewater quality management. Sound 
knowledge of the Water Services Act, 1997 (Act 108 of 1997), 
National Water Act, 1998 (Act No. 36 of 1998) and related 
policies, strategies, regulations and guidelines is required as well 
as knowledge of other relevant legislation e.g. WC/DM Strategy. 
Knowledge of the different market related water treatment 
processes as well as wastewater treatment processes are 
required. Previous training and qualification as a Blue/Green Drop 
Lead Inspector will be an added advantage. Computer literacy. 
Proven, acquired supervisory management, negotiation, 
communication and report writing skills needed (verbal and 
written). Willingness to travel extensively and work irregular hours. 

 
DUTIES:  Implement and enforce the National Water Act (Act No 36 of 

1998), Water Services Act (Act No 108 of 1997) as well as 
Department’s policies and regulations. Manage and supervise a 
team that conduct regular compliance monitoring of both the 
drinking water and wastewater quality of all WSI in the North West 
region. Issuing of noncompliance notices. Conduct the 
assessments of drinking water purification and waste water 
treatment operations. Participate in the national assessments of 
Water Services Authorities (WSA) for Blue / Green Drop 
Certification and Regulatory Performance Measurement System 
(RPMS). Auditing of both the drinking water and wastewater 
quality randomly and or undertake special investigations on 
reports or complaints. Interpret and analyze results and prepare 
reports. Prepare and manage the budget and procurement of the 
division. Serve on various committees and forums. Liaise with 
stakeholders in the water sector and other Government 
Departments. Create awareness of WS regulation in the water 
sector.  

 
ENQUIRIES:    Mr. I. Mokino Tel:  (018) 387 9500 
 
APPLICATIONS Please forward your application quoting the reference number to: 

The Regional Head, Department of Water, Private Bag X05, 
Mmabatho, 2735.  Hand delivered at Motswedi House, 1st Floor, 
Dr James Moroka Drive. 

 
FOR ATTENTION:    Ms Khukhi Mutloane 


